
Extremely simple summary of the Covid plot 

It was all planned for many years 

 The Covid crisis was a hoax to implement certain long-planned authoritarian political strategies. 

 These were to abolish current pandemic plans based on common sense (focused protection of vulnerable, 
keep society working, support hospitals) with idiotic illegal strategies: lockdown of healthy societies, 
facemasks, social distancing, PPE etc. Followed by an universal experimental vaccine programme. 

 These plans were earlier laid out in simulations & reports like: Bill Gates’ Event 201 (2019), Rockefeller’s 
‘Lock-step’ report (2010), the John’s Hopkins University SPARS report (2017), Crimson Contagion 
report (2019) etc. 

 
Purpose 

 To make huge amounts of money for global corporations. [PCR test kits; test and trace methods; 
facemasks; PPE, vaccines etc.] 

 To be a control experiment in social engineering. How far could society be pushed? Could martial law be 
introduced in Western societies based on a health scare and fear? 

 To test mass psychosis methods, military behavioural psychology and NLP. 

 To initiate the vaccine programme years in the planning. To vaccinate the global population with gene 
technology to change human DNA. To insert graphene nano-circuits and antennae for remote 
surveillance. To cause depopulation. To kill the elderly. 

 
There was no pandemic and no deadly virus 

 Public Health England, Scotland, N. Ireland and Wales all downgraded Covid from being a serious 
infectious disease on 19 March 2020. Covid was no threat. 

 From early on the infection fatality rate was known to be low. The average turned out to be 0.035%. Over 
99.9% of people would be under no threat. Many diseases are far more deadly (Sepsis, Pneumonia, 
cancer etc.) but these are lived with. 

 The Institute of Actuaries revealed that there were no significant excess deaths in 2020. In fact, there 
were more excess deaths every year before 2009. 

 Influenza virtually vanished in 2020. This is not possible. It was rebranded as Covid. 

 Genetic sequencing of Covid patients showed that they had Influenza A or B. 

 SARS-Cov-2 was never isolated or purified. Its genetic code was only ever a patented computer 
simulation. 

 The government death statistics were lies. People who died with Covid were listed as dying from Covid. 
E.g. a person dying in a motorbike crash was listed as dying from Covid. Most Covid deaths were actually 
from co-morbidities. 

 The claims of Covid cases were based on the specific PCR test created by Christian Drosten. This was 
fake; his paper was vilified.  His test also targeted human genetic strands and ordinary coronavirus codes 
(e.g. the common cold). PCR tests can never be used for medical diagnoses according to the inventor of 
the technology Kary Mullis. Using a cycling rate over 28 produces false positive results. The NHS used a 
cycling rate of 45; thus every NHS test was useless. These false results led to claims of Covid cases. 

 
The cure was worse than the cause 

 Lockdowns killed more than Covid. They ruined economies, causing the current inflation through excess 
money printing. They destroyed small businesses. They wrecked the education and social development of 
a generation of kids. They caused an explosion of mental health problems. They fragmented society. They 
destroyed supply chains. They spiked suicides. 

 Facemasks are useless to hinder viruses but cause serious medical problems, including cancer. 

 Social distancing is useless in hindering viruses that can travel miles. 

 PPE is pointless in preventing an airborne virus. PCR tests caused medical damage including deaths. 

 The vaccines have caused millions of deaths. [National reporting statistics show about 100,000 deaths in 
the US, UK, EU alone; but these are accepted as being as low as 1% of the real figure. Thus 1,000,000 
likely deaths. This equates to more millions worldwide.] This explains the current global excess deaths. 
Higher vaccinated nations have higher excess deaths. 

 The vaccines have caused millions of serious adverse events including: heart attack, myocarditis, 
pericarditis, blindness, deafness, abortions, stillbirths, nerve damage, paralysis, leg amputations etc. 

 Young people were at no risk from Covid. Yet the vaccine has killed huge numbers of such, including 
deaths of hundreds of fit young athletes on the field. All this is now being exposed in Parliament. 
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